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Muffin maker Merry Wynter hopes to find a buyer for the castle she’s recently inherited. But when
she throws a party to draw interest, she finds someone who’s bought the farm instead…
Merry’s career as a New York City stylist has crumbled, but her passion for muffins has helped her rise
upstate in Autumn Vale. Everyone in town loves the tasty treats. Still, she would like to return to her
glamorous life. Besides, the upkeep of Wynter Castle is expensive, and Merry’s cup isn’t exactly
overflowing.
So in order to bring some prospective buyers into the mix, Merry whisks together a spooky soiree and
decorates the castle with dashes of fabric and a sprinkling of spider webs. Friends new and old are invited,
and everyone has a blast. But as the revelers empty out, Merry notices one partygoer who isn’t leaving—or
breathing. Now Merry must hurry to unmask a killer before her perfect plans turn into a recipe for disaster…
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From reader reviews:

Beatrice Kennemer:

This Muffin But Murder (Merry Muffin Mystery Book 2) book is not really ordinary book, you have it then
the world is in your hands. The benefit you obtain by reading this book is definitely information inside this
reserve incredible fresh, you will get information which is getting deeper you read a lot of information you
will get. This specific Muffin But Murder (Merry Muffin Mystery Book 2) without we understand teach the
one who looking at it become critical in pondering and analyzing. Don't be worry Muffin But Murder (Merry
Muffin Mystery Book 2) can bring whenever you are and not make your handbag space or bookshelves' turn
into full because you can have it with your lovely laptop even telephone. This Muffin But Murder (Merry
Muffin Mystery Book 2) having very good arrangement in word along with layout, so you will not sense
uninterested in reading.

Nora Mickey:

Here thing why this kind of Muffin But Murder (Merry Muffin Mystery Book 2) are different and reliable to
be yours. First of all looking at a book is good but it really depends in the content than it which is the content
is as delightful as food or not. Muffin But Murder (Merry Muffin Mystery Book 2) giving you information
deeper and different ways, you can find any e-book out there but there is no reserve that similar with Muffin
But Murder (Merry Muffin Mystery Book 2). It gives you thrill studying journey, its open up your own eyes
about the thing this happened in the world which is might be can be happened around you. It is easy to bring
everywhere like in recreation area, café, or even in your way home by train. In case you are having
difficulties in bringing the branded book maybe the form of Muffin But Murder (Merry Muffin Mystery
Book 2) in e-book can be your substitute.

John Harrison:

People live in this new day time of lifestyle always try to and must have the extra time or they will get large
amount of stress from both daily life and work. So , when we ask do people have time, we will say
absolutely of course. People is human not really a huge robot. Then we question again, what kind of activity
are you experiencing when the spare time coming to a person of course your answer will probably unlimited
right. Then do you ever try this one, reading books. It can be your alternative within spending your spare
time, the book you have read is definitely Muffin But Murder (Merry Muffin Mystery Book 2).

Christopher Small:

Many people spending their time period by playing outside using friends, fun activity along with family or
just watching TV 24 hours a day. You can have new activity to spend your whole day by looking at a book.
Ugh, you think reading a book can actually hard because you have to bring the book everywhere? It okay
you can have the e-book, bringing everywhere you want in your Touch screen phone. Like Muffin But
Murder (Merry Muffin Mystery Book 2) which is finding the e-book version. So , why not try out this book?
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